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Research Studentships (Master or Integrated Master students) 

Applications are open for 2 Research Studentship within the framework of projectStreets4ALL (1801P.01142.1.01), 
PTDC/ECI-TRA/3120/2021, financed by national funds through FCT, under the following conditions: 

Scientific Area: Civil Engineering/Transport Systems 

Admission Requirements: To be enrolled in the Master's Degree in Transportation Systems or related Master’s 
degree. 

Workplan: The selected grantee will join the Streets 4 All project team and will work predominantly in the final 
phase of the research (last six months of project development), contributing to the scientific dissemination of the 
results and organizing the international closing event.  

The tasks to be developed will include: 

• Systematize and disseminate the scientific results of the project, preparing technical reports and executive 
summaries; 

• Contribute to the organization of the final international seminar of the project, which will bring together 
researchers, policymakers, and stakeholders to discuss the main findings and implications of the research on road 
space dynamic allocation;  

• Develop scientific and institutional materials, including presentations, newsletters, and multimedia content for 
the wide dissemination of the results; 

• Support the curation and publication of a repository of data and tools developed by the project, ensuring 
accessibility and transparency of scientific findings. 

The support work allows the researcher to integrate theoretical knowledge with practical applications, improving 
their coordination, communication, and scientific dissemination skills. This experience is essential for promoting 
innovative solutions in sustainable urban mobility. It is directly applicable to formulating and implementing 
evidence-based policies for the equitable and dynamic reconfiguration of road space. 

Legislation and Regulations: Statute of Scientific Research Fellow, approved by Law nr. 40/2004, of August 18, as 
worded by Decree-Law nr. 123/2019, of August 28; FCT Regulation for Research Studentships and Fellowships, 
available on https://www.fct.pt/apoios/bolsas/docs/RegulamentoBolsasFCT2019.pdf and 
https://dre.pt/application/file/a/127230968 . 

Workplace: The work will be developed at CERIS of Instituto Superior Técnico, under the scientific supervision of 
Filipe Moura and Rosa Félix 

Duration: The research fellowship(s) will last 6 months. It’s expected to begin in July 2025 and may be renewed up 
to a maximum of 12 months, including the duration of the initial contract.  

Monthly maintenance allowance: According to the values for Research Fellowships awarded by FCT in Portugal 
(https://www.fct.pt/fct-atualizou-o-valor-das-bolsas-para-2025/), the amount of the monthly maintenance 
allowance is € 1.040,98, being the payment method an option of the Fellow by Wire Transfer. 



 

Selection methods: The selection methods will be the following: i) Curriculum Vitae evaluation (CV); ii) training and 
experience in the field of transportation systems (especially in urban mobility and public transportation) (EXP); iii) 
individual interview (INT), with the respective weight of (i) CV - 50%, (ii) EXP - 25%; (iii) INT - 25%, in the final grade 
(FG). During the interview, a candidate will be excluded if they do not prove their English proficiency. 

The Final Grade (FG) is calculated with the following equation: FG = 50% x CV + 25% x EXP + 25% x INT. 

Composition of the selection Jury: Filipe Moura, Rosa Félix, Gabriel Valença. 

Announcement/ notification of the results: The final evaluation results will be communicated to all applicants by 
email. 

Deadlines and procedures of complaint and appeal. A complaint may be lodged from the final decision within 15 
working days, or an appeal to the Executive Board of IST-ID within 30 working days, both counted from the 
respective notification 

Application deadline and formalization: The call is open from June 16 until June 30, 2025. 

It is mandatory to formalize applications with the submission of the following documents: i) B1 Form – Fellowship 
application (https://ist-id.pt/concursos/bolsas/ ); ii) Curriculum Vitae; iii) academic degree certificate, where 
applicable; iv) proof of enrollment in a Master degree course.  

Applications must be submitted to the email: teresa.afonso@tecnico.ulisboa.pt  

 

 

 


